
2017 Greenfield Section Line Road 8 Resurfacing Bid Opening: April 28, 2017   9 a.m.
Base Bid-Cold Mix Overlay and Seal Coat from Daniels Road east to State Route 162 (Section Line Road 30) 

REF. 
NO.

ITEM 
NO.

QUANTITY UNITS Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 103.1 1 LUMP 3,000.00$       3,000.00$             1,000.00$   1,000.00$          
2 405 13650 Gal. 1.80$              24,570.00$           2.75$          37,537.50$        
3 405 685 Ton 45.00$            30,825.00$           45.00$        30,825.00$        
4 405 46 Ton 25.00$            1,150.00$             145.00$      6,670.00$          
5 407 910 Gal. 1.75$              1,592.50$             2.00$          1,820.00$          
6 409 4100 Gal. 2.00$              8,200.00$             2.90$          11,890.00$        
7 409 78 Ton 90.00$            7,020.00$             16.00$        1,248.00$          
8 441 200 C.Y. 180.00$          36,000.00$           175.00$      35,000.00$        
9 614 1 LUMP $3,000.00 $3,000.00 6,000.00$       6,000.00$             9,320.00$   9,320.00$          

10 624 1 LUMP $2,000.00 $2,000.00 2,500.00$       2,500.00$             3,500.00$   3,500.00$          
REF. 
NO.

ITEM 
NO.

QUANTITY UNITS

11 Spec. 2 Each $500.00 1,000.00$       2,000.00$             550.00$      1,100.00$          
12 Spec. 1 LUMP $3,800.00 XX XX

Total Base $131,720.00 122,857.50$         139,910.50$      

ALTERNATE No. 1 (use CM-150 in place of CMS-2)
Delete 405 13650 Gal. NO BID NO BID (2.75)$         (37,537.50)$       
Insert 405 9100 Gal. NO BID NO BID 3.25$          29,575.00$        

Total Using Alt. #1 $0.00 NO BID 131,948.00$      

ALTERNATE No. 2 Cold Mix Overlay and Seal Coat from Jennifer Road to Daniels Road
1 405 11550 Gal. 1.80$              20,790.00$           2.75$          31,762.50$        
2 405 580 Ton 45.00$            26,100.00$           45.00$        26,100.00$        
3 405 40 Ton 25.00$            1,000.00$             145.00$      5,800.00$          
4 407 780 Gal. 1.75$              1,365.00$             2.00$          1,560.00$          
5 409 3500 Gal. 2.00$              7,000.00$             2.90$          10,150.00$        
6 409 65 Ton 90.00$            5,850.00$             16.00$        1,040.00$          

Total Alt. #2 $71,550.00 62,105.00$           76,412.50$        

ALTERNATE No. 3  (use CM-150 in place of CMS-2 with Alternate No. 2)
Delete 405 11550 Gal. NO BID NO BID (2.75)$         (31,762.50)$       
Insert 405 7700 Gal. NO BID NO BID 3.25$          25,025.00$        

Total Using Alt. #3 $0.00 NO BID 69,675.00$        

Grand Total $203,270.00 184,962.50$         216,323.00$      

CM-150, Mix Bituminous @ 1.0 Gal./Sq. Yd. $4.50 $34,650.00
CMS-2, Mix Bituminous @1.5 Gal./Sq. Yd. $3.00 $34,650.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
ESTIMATED 

COST

Seal Coat Cover Aggregate #9 Lime Stone @ 17 lbs./Sq. Yd. $50.00 $3,250.00

CMS-2, Mix Bituminous @1.5 Gal./Sq. Yd. $3.00 $34,650.00
Mix Aggregate, #67's @ 150 lbs./Sq. Yd. $35.00 $20,300.00
Choke Aggregate, #8's @ 10 lbs./Sq. Yd. $40.00 $1,600.00
Tack Coat, 0.10 gal. per SY

$2.80 $9,800.00

CM-150, Mix Bituminous @ 1.0 Gal./Sq. Yd. $4.50 $40,950.00

$2.50 $1,950.00
Seal Coat Bituminous Material, CRS-2 @ 0.45 Gal./Sq. Yd.

Choke Aggregate, #8's @ 10 lbs./Sq. Yd. $40.00 $1,840.00

CMS-2, Mix Bituminous @1.5 Gal./Sq. Yd. $3.00 $40,950.00

Butt Joints $1,000.00
Contingencies $3,800.00

Seal Coat Bituminous Material, CRS-2 @ 0.45 Gal./Sq. Yd.
Seal Coat Cover Aggregate #9 Lime Stone @ 17 lbs./Sq. Yd.
Asph. Conc. Surface Course, Type 1 (448) Modified, Variable Depth

$50.00 $3,900.00
$180.00

Mix Aggregate, #67's @ 150 lbs./Sq. Yd. $35.00

UNIT PRICEDESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 
COST

$23,975.00

MELWAY PAVING CO. ERIE BLACKTOP, INC.

$1,500.00

Mobilization

$2,275.00

$1,500.00Premium for Contract Performance and Maintenance Guarantee Bond
$3.00

Maintaining Traffic

$2.50

$36,000.00

Tack Coat, 0.10 gal. per SY

$40,950.00

$2.80 $11,480.00

CMS-2, Mix Bituminous @1.5 Gal./Sq. Yd.
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